
Can you 
defeat 
them all?
“This is it, kids. This is your final 
challenge in the Drug Buster 
Buddies Camp,” the instructor 
tells Kevin and Emmy.

The young trainees look up 
and see the entrance to an 
enchanting hedge maze.

“At the other end of this 
labyrinth is Captain Drug Buster 
himself. He’s eagerly waiting 
for the new batch of Drug 
Buster Buddies to help him 
maintain a #DrugFreeSG.

“Your task is to make it 
through this maze. However, 
danger lies ahead. Along the 
way, you will encounter harmful 
and illegal drugs that are up to 
their old tricks. It’s up to you to 
make the right choices to move 
ahead and reach the finish 
line.”

Help Kevin and Emmy make 
the right decisions to get to the 
other end of the maze!

BROUGHT TO YOU BY

Contest 
Gather your 
family to take 
part in CNB’s 
#DrugFreeSG 
Light-Up 
Instagram Filter 
contest together. 
There are $300 
worth of Grab 
vouchers to be 
won! Scan the 
QR code below 
to find out how 
to participate.

The contest ends 
on July 18, 2021, 
so send in your 
submissions now!

How to participate
STEP 1. Follow CNB on 
Instagram (@CNB.DrugFreeSG) 
and select the #DrugFreeSG 
Light-Up filter.

STEP 2. Choose a backdrop 
filter and snap a photo using 
Instagram Story!

STEP 3. Tell us what you live 
for by adding text in the speech 
bubble above your head. It 
could be #ILiveFor food, sports 
or music!

STEP 4. Include #DrugFreeSG 
and tag @CNB.DrugFreeSG in 
your post.

STEP 5. Publish! Make sure 
your account is set to public. 
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